




Re: Support for Hawkeswood Resources Limited – Millers Flat Gold Mine 
 
I am wri=ng to express my strong support for the proposed gold mine project in our 
community. I believe that this endeavour will bring numerous benefits to our region and its 
residents. 
 
First and foremost, the establishment of the gold mine will create job opportuni=es for local 
residents. In an era where job crea=on is paramount for economic growth and stability, this 
project promises to employ individuals across various skill levels, from mining and extrac=on 
to administra=ve and support roles. 
 
Furthermore, the gold mine will contribute significantly to our local economy. The influx of 
investment and revenue generated from mining opera=ons will have a mul=plier effect, 
benefi=ng local businesses, suppliers, and service providers. This economic s=mula=on will 
enhance the prosperity of our community and improve the standard of living for its 
residents. 
 
Moreover, the responsible development and opera=on of the gold mine will adhere to 
stringent environmental regula=ons and employ best prac=ces in sustainable mining. 
Modern mining techniques and technologies priori=se environmental conserva=on and 
minimise ecological impact. Addi=onally, the company's commitment to environmental 
stewardship includes measures for land reclama=on and rehabilita=on post-mining 
ac=vi=es, ensuring the long-term preserva=on of our natural surroundings. 
 
In terms of community engagement, the proponents of the gold mine have demonstrated a 
genuine willingness to collaborate with local stakeholders, including residents, community 
organisa=ons, and government agencies. This inclusive approach fosters transparency, 
accountability, and mutual understanding, thereby fostering posi=ve rela=onships between 
the project proponents and the community. 
 
Lastly, the gold mine represents an opportunity for our community to diversify its economic 
base and reduce dependency on a single industry or sector. By harnessing our natural 
resources responsibly, we can build resilience and sustainability for future genera=ons, 
ensuring con=nued growth and prosperity. 
 
In conclusion, I urge you to support the approval and implementa=on of the proposed gold 
mine project. It represents a pivotal opportunity for our community to achieve economic 
growth, environmental stewardship, and social progress. 
 
 
Kind Regards, 

 
 
 
 

Simon Johnstone 


